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PRESS RELEASE 
 
BAHMÜLLER TURBOX conquers France 
 
Yes we can!  
Would a famous American tell to the 
audience. 
 
Of course – we did! 
Is finally the statement of BAHMÜLLER. 
 
February 2015 - first TURBOX speciality 
folder gluer line is installed in France. 
 
Family owned company CARTONNAGE 
VIALLON et Cie. in Saint-Just-Malmont Dep 
Haute-Loire decided 2014 to invest in 
German technology. 
 
Not only a TURBOX with TOPMATCHER 
has been installed, also the state-of-the-art 
POWERPACKER II system found its place 
inside the factory. 
 
The TURBOX LINE will run adjacent to 
existing multipoint gluer and several flatbed 
die-cutters next to Inline machines different 
sizes. 
 
Equipped with a TOPMATCHER feeder the 
machine will produce shelf ready packaging 
boxes in several versions at unmatched 
speed and quality. 
The TURBOX is equipped with the latest 
innovations from BAHMÜLLER, including a 
set-up time reduction kit and additional 
tooling. Unmatched simplicity at 
BOXFLOW®CONTROL HMI led to a short 
training period, thanks to the operators who 
used to work with other brand SFG. 
 
Overall the machine is prepared for 
sustainable production at highest quality 
level with integrated glue control and 
UNIQUE EJECT system to discharge faulty 
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boxes. An essential kit in conjunction with 
the automatic POWERPACKER. 
 
UNIQUE FOLD – servo controlled rotation 
hook – enables the designers of VIALLON 
to offer further solutions to their customers. 
A further step to customer satisfaction. 
 
The new BAHMÜLLER TURBOX completes 
the excellent equipment of VIALLON and 
marks the continuous improvements and 
sustainable investment, Mr Christian 
VIALLON is well known for. 
If quality and short delivery is the key to 
success, production must be ready to keep 
pace with the expectations. 
 
 
Contact: 
Cartonnages Viallon et Cie. 
ZI La Font du Loup 
43240 ST. JUST MALMONT 
FRANKREICH 
 


